WARREN CONSOLIDATED SCHOOLS
Ashestos Abatement Bid Tabulation

February 15, 2017

BID 1: ANGUS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 2: CROMIE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 3: HARWOOD FELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 4: HATHERLY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 5: HOLDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID} 6: JEFFERSON ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 7: PEARL LEAN CLEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID §: SIERSMA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 9: WILDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 10: WILLOW WOODS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 11: COUSING ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID 12: MOTT ELEMENTARY SCHOQOL

CONTRACTOR BID FAMILIAL iRAN
BOND DISCLOSURE DISCLOSURE | ADDENDUM BID 1 BD 2 BID3 BIDa BID 5 nipg BID7 BID 2 BID% BID 10 BiD11 BID 12
STATEMENT STATEMENT 1

QUALITY ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
QUALIFIED ABATEMENT SERVICES ¥ ¥ ¥ ¥ $22,500.00 | $29,500.00 | $22,500.00 | $22,500.00 | $22,500.00 $22,500.00 | $22,500.00 | $12,800.00 | $19,800.00 | $22,500.00 | $69,000.00 | $6,500.00
EME - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
TOTAL ENVIRONMENTAL il ¥ J v $23,260.00 | $28.480.00 | $23,260.00 | $23.260.00 | $22,140.00 | $23,980.00 | s41,800.00 | $16.440.00 | $32.655.00 §23,260.00 | $41,800.00 | $9,350.00
TRUST THERMAL ABATEMENT - - - - NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BIR NO BID NO BID NO BID
MWV ¥ ¥ ¥ il NO BID NO BID NOBID | §25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | NOBID NG BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
PTSI - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOD BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NOBID NO BID NG BID
CERTIFIED ABATEMENT SERVCES INC, - - - NG BID NO BID NG BID NG BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NQ BID




